
 
 

October 17, 2014              FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 
 
 
Marie Vidal is Awarded the Raymond James Network for Women Advisors 2014 
Women of Distinction Award 
 
Atlanta, GA – Marie Vidal has been awarded the 2014 Woman of Distinction for the 
Southern Division of Raymond James. 
 
This award is given to women advisors with Raymond James who are exceptional in 
both their professional and personal contributions. The award was created to recognize 
women advisors who both influence others in the financial industry and who make a 
positive impact on their communities. The recipients are nominated by top management 
at Raymond James, and the award is presented during the annual Women’s Symposium 
held in St. Petersburg, Florida. 
 
“The Women of Distinction awards are given to those that inspire others. These women 
are making a difference and that is something to recognize and celebrate” says Nicole 
Spinelli, director of the Network for Women Advisors at Raymond James. 
  
 
 
About Raymond James Financial, Inc. 
Raymond James Financial, Inc. (NYSE: RJF) is a leading diversified financial services 
company providing private client group, capital markets, asset management, banking, 
and other services to individuals, corporations, and municipalities. Its three principal 
wholly owned broker-dealers, Raymond James & Associates, Raymond James Financial 
Services, and Raymond James Ltd., have approximately 6,200 financial advisors serving 
in excess of 2.5 million client accounts in approximately 2,500 locations throughout the 
United States, Canada and overseas. Total client assets are approximately $473 billion.  
Public since 1983, the firm has been listed on the New York Stock Exchange since 1986 
under the symbol RJF.  Additional information is available at www.raymondjames.com.  
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For additional information, contact Marie Vidal at 770-952-1345 or 
Marie.Vidal@RaymondJames.com, or visit RAYMONDJAMES.COM/MEDIA 
or http://www.raymondjames.com/vidal. 
 
http://www.fa-mag.com/news/raymond-james-awards--woman-of-distinction-
19507.html?section=143 
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